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UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT e
MIDDLE DISTRICT OF FLORIDA '

JACKSONVILLE DIVISION
In re: Case No. 3:15-md-2626 HES-LLL
DISPOSABLE CONTACT LENS - ;};
ANTITRUST LITIGATION. :
This document relates to ALL CLASS MOTION RECONSIDERATION
ACTIONS.
/

IR

I, Jill Swanson, motion reconsideration of the decision of the Court made November 29, 2023. My
objection was filed after the Order due to no fault of my own. I had mailed it as soon as I saw the motion
on the claims website. The motion was buried on the documents page of the website. I saw it when I was
looking up the status due to my missing check. I do not think that the court knew that there are people
harmed by the claims administrator’s failure to make sure people got paid. I stated in my objection that I
object to the motion filed by Class Counsel seeking to redistribute my funds. The motion was quite
surprising since it does not accurately reflect what was done to people like me. I requested a reissued
check on July 8, 2023 and was told in an email from Epiq on July 11th that my payment was being
reissued. My reissue request fell within what the Class Counsel promised in their motion.

Because I had not yet received my settlement check, and because I needed to update my email address,
I contacted Epiq again on November 9, 2023 to inquire regarding the status of my payment. I was told
that the payment was sent on 09/20/2023 and returned to them by the post office as undeliverable. I do
not know why this would have happened as the address is good and I regularly receive correspondence to
the mailing address provided. Did Epiq make a mistake on the mailing? Did the USPS misdirect the
mailing? 1 have no way of knowing.

I was further advised that my payment was no longer able to be reissued after 09/20/2023. 1 note that I
was never contacted by Epiq via email or otherwise after the alleged undeliverable mailing occurred,
whether to confirm that my address was correct, or otherwise. I was the one who had to contact them to
ask why my reissued payment had not arrived.

I do not consent to having my settlement payment redistributed to other class members due to mailing
issues that are no fault of my own. I do not understand why people like me who may have experienced
some error in the course of Epiq attempting to deliver a check would not be allowed to attempt to rectify
this and follow up their payment that could in no way be classified as “abandoned” or “forfeited”.
Furthermore 1 should also be eligible for any second distribution that becomes payable to the class. |
cannot find these capricious rules, the deadlines outlined in the motion, or how to appeal the refusal to
reissue anywhere in the documentation on the website. Below is a copy of my most recent email to Epiq
and their response denying me a reissued payment:

Dear Jill Swanson,
Thank you for your email.
This is to confirm we have received your request for a change of email address and have updated our
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records accordingly. Our records indicate that a Settlement payment was mailed on 9/20/2023 to the
following address: PO BOX 591, PUTNAM, CT 06260 and returned as Undeliverable. There will be no
further reissues beyond 9/20/2023 for this settlement.

Regards,

Christian R.

Disposable Contact Lens Settlement Administrator

Original Message
From: vaportime@terraemail.com
Received: 11/9/2023 5:02 AM

To: info(@ContactLensSettlement.com

Subject: Disposable Contacts Antitrust Litigation— Website Correspondence
Website Correspondence

Name: Jill Swanson

Message: Hello. My previous email address is jillyfumes3@vaporcoutre.com (which I no longer have access to),
and my claim code is KCQOUVB2. I have contacted you before. You responded to me on July 11 (I have
retained a copy of your email) stating that you were in the process of reissuing my settlement check. I still have
not received that and it is almost 4 months later now. Can you please let me know the status of the reissue?
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Thank you for your consideration,

A Jinezrnion
J. Swanson
Crystal Putman Loft
PO BOX 591
PUTNAM, CT 06260
vaportime(@terraemail.com



